
“the time has come to liberate the NHS frontline.”
Amen, say all of us.

The first reaction to Mr Milburn’s speech is,
however, likely to be one of cynicism. At one time or
other all secretaries of state for health—Conservative as
well as Labour—have rhetorically embraced the notion
of devolving power. But this has not stopped a
seemingly unstoppable trend towards ever greater cen-
tralisation, culminating with the present government.
However, it is worth giving Mr Milburn the benefit of
the doubt on two counts. Firstly, his speech marks pub-
lic recognition of the fact that government policies
depend on engaging the enthusiasm of those working
in the NHS and that there is a danger that staff may feel
“disempowered or disillusioned” as well as overloaded.
Not before time, it might be said, but at least the sinner
shows signs of repentance. Secondly, his speech repre-
sents an attempt to show why the new vision should be
seen not as a retreat from the previous emphasis on
centralisation but as evidence that the government’s
command and control strategy has worked. This
contention is not self evidently convincing but is worth
exploring.

Mr Milburn’s argument runs as follows. Given that
the aim of the government’s strategy is “to make the
best practice in one part of the health service the norm
in all of its parts”—or, as Aneurin Bevan, the politician
responsible for establishing the NHS in 1948, put it, to
universalise the best—then it follows that a strong
machinery of control has to be established. National
standards have to be set. National service frameworks
have to be promulgated. There has to be a system of
inspection. Otherwise anarchy rules: variation would
continue to be the norm in the NHS as it has been for
the past half century. But once the corset of control has
been created, then it becomes possible to allow more
freedom within it in the knowledge that liberty is not a
licence for poor standards or inadequate performance.
The emphasis can switch from hierarchical managerial
control to adopting a missionary, developmental style
of promoting best practice through the new Moderni-
sation Agency.

The logic is persuasive. But there are problems. Not
only is “universalising the best” an oxymoron. The

phrase also assumes that the “best” can be determined
by central government rather than being defined vari-
ously and experimentally in the light of local
circumstances: not for nothing was the NHS, as created
by Bevan, a monument to paternalistic technocracy.
Narrowing the range of quality and performance is
unquestionably desirable. So is prodding poor
performers towards achieving what the best do already.
But it is far from clear from Mr Milburn’s pronounce-
ment how much discretion trusts and others will have
to diverge from national norms or to experiment.
Freedom for them will lie in the knowledge of
necessity: if they deliver the government’s goals, they
will be allowed a degree of (unspecified ) discretion.
Clearly therefore there is a need for much more debate
about what are, or are not, acceptable variations, as well
as for a cull of the ever proliferating range of targets
and goals set by the government.

If scepticism is the inevitable first reaction to Mr
Milburn’s vision, a more considered verdict might
therefore be to welcome it as providing the criteria
against which the record of a second term Labour gov-
ernment can be assessed. And given this government’s
dedication to setting targets, perhaps the next step
would be for the secretary of state to announce a set of
devolution performance indicators. The National Plan
committed itself to a reduction in the number of circu-
lars produced by the centre. Other indicators might be
the number of telephone calls from the secretary of
state’s private office to NHS managers and the volume
of reports demanded by and flowing into the
Department of Health. No doubt many others could be
devised. The challenge to Mr Milburn—or his
successor—will be to demonstrate that reality can
match rhetoric.

Rudolf Klein senior associate
King’s Fund, London W1G 0AN
(rudolfklein30@netscapeonline.co.uk)
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Understanding the burden of musculoskeletal
conditions
The burden is huge and not reflected in national health priorities

Musculoskeletal conditions have an enormous
and growing impact world wide. “Health 21,”
the health for all policy framework for the

World Health Organization’s European region,1 identi-
fies musculoskeletal conditions as a target, yet national
health care priorities in the United Kingdom and most
European countries do not include them. To address
this imbalance the United Nation, the WHO,
governments, and professional and patients’ organisa-
tions have declared 2000-10 the “bone and joint
decade” with the aim of improving the health related

quality of life of people with musculoskeletal
conditions.

Although one of the aims of the decade is to
increase the recognition and understanding of the
burden posed by musculoskeletal conditions, there are
already enough data to show the size of the problem.
Musculoskeletal impairments ranked number one in
chronic impairments in the United States,2 and chronic
musculoskeletal pain is reported in surveys by 1 in 4
people in both less and more developed countries.3

Musculoskeletal conditions were the most expensive

Editorials

BMJ 2001;322:1079–80

1079BMJ VOLUME 322 5 MAY 2001 bmj.com



disease category in a Swedish cost of illness study, rep-
resenting 22.6% of the total cost of illness.4 Measured
in terms of disability adjusted life years (DALYs), osteo-
arthritis is the 4th most frequent predicted cause of
health problems worldwide in women and the 8th in
men5; rheumatoid arthritis restricts work capacity in a
third of people within the first year6; fractures related to
osteoporosis will be sustained by about 40% of all
white women aged over 507; the one year prevalence of
low back pain in the UK is almost 50%8; 23-34 million
people are injured world- wide each year in road traffic
accidents9; and work related musculoskeletal disorders
were responsible for 11 million days lost from work in
1995 in the UK.10 Yet only 5% or less of national
research councils’ spending is allocated to musculo-
skeletal conditions in established market economies.

From large areas of the globe incidence and preva-
lence figures are rudimentary or lacking, but
epidemiological studies in less developed countries11

show that musculoskeletal conditions are just as
important a problem as in more developed countries.
The impact of musculoskeletal conditions and trauma
varies between different parts of the world and is influ-
enced by social structure, expectation, and economics.
Nevertheless, with population growth and increased
longevity, urbanisation, and more use of cars, the
burden is increasing.

Why is the importance of musculoskeletal condi-
tions underappreciated? Is it because they are rarely
fatal, are considered irreversible, and are associated
with age? Older people place a very high marginal
value on maintaining independence and dignity,12 and
preventive measures and effective treatments are now
available that can significantly improve the outcome of
musculoskeletal conditions. However, the recently
demonstrated underuse of hip and knee arthroplasty13

reflects the lack of knowledge, negative attitudes, and
low expectations that surround these conditions.

A primary objective of the bone and joint decade is
to provide, in collaboration with the WHO Global
Burden of Disease 2000 Project, information on the
burden caused by musculoskeletal conditions to
inform debates on priorities and strategies. In addition,
defining methods of measuring and monitoring these
conditions will enable trends to be predicted and allow
planning of research and development, training, and
investment in health services.

For these largely chronic non-fatal conditions,
disability assessment is more important than mortality
figures, and the WHO revised classification of effects of
health conditions, the ICIDH-2, provides a framework
to describe these consequences and factors that may
influence them. Summary measures of population
health, such as disability adjusted life years (DALYs),
facilitate comparisons between different conditions by
combining information on mortality and non-fatal
health outcomes, but estimating these for chronic, pro-
gressive conditions with variable outcomes poses chal-
lenges and can undervalue life with disability.
Indicators that can also integrate evidence from
randomised controlled studies with evidence gained in
clinical practice to identify interventions that improve
health are needed to assess the consequence of a
disease for both the individual and the population.

At present few indicators relevant to musculo-
skeletal conditions are routinely collected either in

national health statistics or by the WHO Health for All
2000 statistical databases. We need to identify such
indicators and advocate their use. At the level of the
individual better measures of long term morbidity
need to be agreed and data collected. A recent WHO
scientific group meeting considered pain, mobility, and
independence to be the most relevant domains for
musculoskeletal conditions, and it identified the need
for simpler instruments usable in all populations to
monitor these aspects. The meeting represented the
first phase of a global health needs assessment exercise
for musculoskeletal conditions, the bone and joint
monitor project, which also aims to show what can be
achieved by effective evidence based strategies to
reduce the burden.

Recognition of the burden of musculoskeletal con-
ditions will result in greater awareness of the pervasive
effects they have on individuals and of their cost to
society. Measuring the burden should ensure they
receive higher priority in health strategies. The
application of agreed indicators will allow these condi-
tions to be monitored and interventions evaluated. In
these ways understanding the burden will ultimately
improve outcome for individuals.

Anthony D Woolf professor of rheumatology
Royal Cornwall Hospital, Truro TR1 3LJ

Kristina Åkesson associate professor
Department of Orthopaedics, Malmö University Hospital, S-20502,
Malmö, Sweden

On behalf of the participants of the WHO and Bone and Joint
Decade scientific group meeting on the burden of musculo-
skeletal conditions at the start of the new millennium, Geneva
2000.
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